



Republic of the Philippines
Department of Agriculture
NATIONAL DAIRY AUTHORITY
Central Office
BAI Compound, Visayas Avenue, Diliman, Quezon City 1101 Philippines
Tel. No.: (632) 8926-0733-35 Fax: (632) 8926-8847
Email: dairynda@pldtDSL.net | Website: http://nda.da.gov.ph

Page	:	Page 1 of 2
Date Prep.	:	5/18/2021 4:02 PM
Traceability Code		

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE CENTRAL OFFICE

RESOLUTION No. 5-18-1
18 May 2021

REF: HARD HAT, REFLECTIVE VEST, AGRICULTURAL ELECTRIC WATER PUMP, ETC. TO BE USED DURING THE QUARANTINE OF DAIRY GOATS

WHEREAS, that the documents for the purchase of Hard Hat, Reflective Vest, Agricultural Electric Water Pump, Etc. to be used during the Quarantine of Dairy Goats including the TWG Evaluation Report were reviewed and accordingly acted upon;

WHEREAS, that the said items were published at the PhilGEPS Portal under Shopping from 15 May 2021 to 18 May 2021;

WHEREAS, there are three (3) suppliers submitted their quotations namely: NCAI Construction Services, MBKK Enterprises, and InterPhil;

WHEREAS, that upon review of the technical evaluation report of the TWG, the suppliers complied with the technical specification set forth by the end-user and within the Approved Budget of the Contract (ABC);

WHEREAS, that based on the Technical Working Group (TWG) Evaluation Report dated 17 May 2021, item 13 have no bid offer, therefore, shall be returned to the end-user for appropriate action/canvass;

WHEREAS, both NCAI Construction Services and MBKK Enterprises have an equal offer for item nos. 7, 12, and 18, however, it shall be noted that MBKK Enterprises is not a PhilGEPS registered. Therefore, the aforementioned items are recommended by the TWG to be purchased to NCAI Construction Services;

No.	PARTICULARS	ABC	NCAI CONSTRUCTION SERVICES	MBKK ENTEPRISES	INTERPHIL
1	Hard Hat with Lights	16,000.00	16,000.00	16,200.00	20,000.00
2	Reflective Safety Vest	6,000.00	6,000.00	7,000.00	10,000.00
3	Agricultural Electric Water Pump Rechargeable 16L	10,000.00	10,000.00	12,000.00	NO BID
4	Plastic Drum with Cover 60L	1,000.00	1,000.00	2,000.00	NO BID
5	Garbage Bag Black Large	1,200.00	1,200.00	1,240.00	NO BID
6	Garbage Bag Black Medium	1,000.00	1,000.00	1,020.00	NO BID
7	Flashlight Heavy Duty	4,000.00	4,000.00	4,000.00	6,000.00
8	Nylon Rope 10mm	4,000.00	4,000.00	4,300.00	7,000.00
9	Insulated Cooler box (16 Quart)	6,000.00	6,000.00	6,100.00	8,000.00
10	Resealable Plastic Bags/Press n Seal Plastic Bags (L)	3,000.00	3,000.00	3,300.00	NO BID
11	Resealable Plastic Bags/Press n Seal Plastic Bags (M)	3,000.00	3,000.00	3,150.00	NO BID
12	Resealable Plastic Bags/Press n Seal Plastic Bags (S)	10,000.00	10,000.00	10,000.00	NO BID



Management System
ISO 9001:2015



www.tuv.com
ID 9108653229

A food-secure Philippines

with prosperous farmers and fisherfolk

